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NOTICE OF HEARING

The Illinois PoIIuton Control Board
gives notice of public hearings regard-
ing rule changes proposed by the
Board on October 19, 201 7: In The Mat-
ter of: Amendments to 35 Ill. Adm. Code
225.233, Multi-Pollutant Standards
(MPS), R18-20. If adopted by the
Board, the Illinois Environmental Pro-
tection Agency (Illinois EPA) intends to
submit any rules adopted by the Board
in this rulemaking to the United States
Environmental Protection Agency
(USEPA) for review and approval as a
revision to the Illinois Regional Haze
State Implementation Plan (SIP) to ad-
dress the visibility protection require-
ments for federal Class I under the
federal Clean Air Act. See 42 U.S.C. §
7491 . The revisions submitted to
USEPA will include not only amend-
ments to current regulatory provisions
proposed by IEPA but also newly cre
ated provisions, along with an analysis
demonstrating that the amended rules
do not interfere with attainment or main-
tenance of any applicable National Am-
bient Air Quality Standard, reasonable
further progress, or any other applica
ble requirement ofthe federal Clean Air
Act. Interested persons are invited to at-
tend the hearings and to submit written
comments. The Public Hearings will be
held on January 17, 2018, at 10:00 am
at the Peoria Public Library Main Li-
brary, Auditorium, 107 NE Monroe
Street, Peoria, IL 61602; to be contin
ued if necessary on January 1 8, 2018,
at 10:00 am; and March 6, 2018, at
10:00 am at the Madison County Gov
ernment Center, County Board Room,
157 North Main Street, Edwardsville, IL
62025; to be continued if necessary on
March 7, 2018. The hearings are sub-
ject to cancellation without notice and
may be confirmed by calling the Office
ofthe Clerk at 312/814-3461 . A copy of
the proposal for public comment is
available for public inspection on the
Board’s website at
hffp:llwww.ipcb.state.il.us/, and in the
Clerk’s Office, Pollution Control Board,
Suite 11-500, James R. Thompson
Center, 100 West Randolph Street,
Chicago, Illinois.

Katie Papadimitriu
Chairman
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